
CAST          Philippa O’Hara 
A professional actor and singer from Belfast. She has
been lucky enough to tour Ireland, China, Norway and
America five times with various Cahoots N.I. shows.
She is a guest vocalist with Lush! Classical and Cream
Classical performing in huge venues with symphony
orchestras in front of up to 18,000 people, videos of
which have garnered over 9 million views on YouTube.
She performs regularly with her sister as the O’Hara
Sisters at prestigious events all over the U.K. and
Ireland including The Players’ Dinner at The Open
2019 and at extremely exclusive, bespoke events at
The Tate Modern, London. Her recent theatre credits
include The Vanishing Elephant at New Victory
Theatre New York, Secrets Of Space USA tour, and
Cinderella at The Mac.

Tennessee-born Kellee "Broadway" Fuller has been
immersed in music and theater since childhood. She
earned a BFA in Musical Theatre Acting from the
University of Mississippi and has since performed in
collegiate, regional, and off-off- Broadway
productions, including Godspell, Rent, Blues for an
Alabama Sky, The Drowsy Chaperone, Barney Gets
His Wings, Suor Angelica, and The Color Purple.
From Memphis to NYC and now Austin, Kellee has
expanded her talents in music as a singer with the
award-winning band Shinyribs. In 2021, she co-
founded YOSO LLC, a media production company
and artists' collective dedicated to amplifying the
voices of Black and Brown artists in the Austin
community. 
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